BID TABULATION
2025 Roadway Maintenance Project
Bid Opening March 13, 2025

Bid Asphalt Preservation Staker & Parsons Co. Morgan Asphalt Morgan Pavement Maint.
I:Ie: Description Qua]ntity Unit
: Unit Price Total Unit Price Tetal Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
BID SCHEDULE “A” - SLURRY SEAlL TYPE Il
A1 | [uTshand install Sty Seal Tyoe | 1250,000 | SF $0.1520 |  $190,000.00 $0.1765 | $220,625.00
NO BID NO BID
SUB TOTAL - BID SCHEDULE “A” $190,000.00 $220,625.00
Comments|
BID SCHEDULE “B” - LIGHT WEIGHT AGGREGATE CHIP SEAL
Furnish and Instafl Light Weight
B1 Aggregate Chip Seal 2,000,000 SF $0.45 $900,000.00
B2 Furnigh :_and Install 4™ Double Sofid 2350 LE $4.75 $11,162.50
Yellow Line
B3 E:{g;heﬁ‘t‘fﬂg’r::g Stop Bar 8 EA $83.00 $654.00
B4 | Furnish and Install Cross Walk . A NG BID $670.00 5269000 NO BID NGO BID
Pavement Marking ) T
Fumish and Install School
BS Pavement Marking B EA $182.00 §1,002.00
8UB TOTAL - BID SCHEDULE “B” $917,608.50
Comments
e A ————————————
EID SCHEDULE “C” - ROTO-MILL. AND ASPHALT OVERLAY
Remove, Adjust and Reinstall
c1 Concrete Cellars Around Water 17 EA $10,455.00 $17.671.50
Valves and Survey Monuments $815.00 $1.089.50
Remove, Adjust and Reinstall
©2 | Goncrete Coltars Around Manhole 15 EA $815.00 | $12,225.00 §1.320.00 | §19,800.00
Roto-Mill Edge of Existing
c3 Roadways {taper 2" below lip of 5,900 LF NO BID NO BID $2.80 $16,520.00 $5.80 $33,040.00
C4 | Furnish and Install Level Course 200 TON $120.00 $24,000.00 $180.00 $36,000.00
- —
cs f\:g;::ﬂ andInstal 2047 PG 6428 | 45000 | sF $1.69 |  5245,050.00 $220 | $319,000.00
SUB TOTAL - BID SCHEDULE ~“C” $308,250.00 $425,511.50
Comments
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BID TABULATION
2025 Roadway Maintenance Project
Bid Opening March 13, 2025

" Black Forest Pavement C&B Asphalt American Pa\{ement Staker & Parson Companies
Item _ e Bid . Preservation
No Bescription Quantity Linit
’ Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
BID SCHEDULE *A” - SLURRY SEAL TYPE 1l
At | [UmeD and nstall Sturry Seal Type | 1 250,000 | SF $0.1750 |  $218,750.00 $0.2200 | $275,000.00
— NO BID NO BID
SUB TOTAL - BID SCHEDULE “A” $218,750.00 $275,000.00
Comments
BID SCHEDULE “B” - LIGHT WEIGHT AGGREGATE CHIP SEAL
Furnish and Install Light Weight
B1 Aggregate Chip Seal 2,000,000 SF
B Furnish gnd Install 4° Double Solid 2,350 LF
Yellow Line
Furnish and Install Stop Bar
B3 - 8 EA
Pavement Marking NO BID
54| Fumish and Install Gross Walk . A NO BID NO BID NOBID
Pavement Marking
Furnish and Install School
BS Pavement Marking 6 EA
SUB TOTAL - BID SCHEDULE “B”
Comments
BID SCHEDULE “C” - ROTO-MILL AND ASPHALT OVERLAY
Remove, Adjust and Reinstall
c1 Concrete Collars Around Water 17 EA $900.00 $15,300.00 $915.00 $15,5565.00 $715.00 $12,155.00
Valves and Survey Monuments )
Remove, Adjust and Reinstall
cz Cancrete Callars Around Manhale 15 EA $1,050.00 $15,750.00 $1,082.00 $16,230.00 $915.00 $13,725.00
Roto-Mill Edge of Existing
cs Roadways (taper 2° below fip of 5,900 LF $6.00 $35,400.00 $2.43 $14,337.00 NO BID $4.20 $24,780.00
4 Furnish and Install Level Course 200 TON $130.00 $26,000.00 $124.00 $24,800.00 $162.00 $32,400.00
- ryr
cs ;zg;]'z:} and Install 2 %" PG 64-28 145000 | SF $1.82 |  $263,000.00 $1.80 |  $261,000.00 $2.06 | $297,250.00
SUB TOTAL - BID SCHEDULE “C™ $356,350.00 $331,922.00 $380,310.00

Comments
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BIB TABULATION
2025 Readway Maintenance Project
Bid Opening March 13, 2025

B B Hlne. Intermountain Slurry Seal
Item D it Bid Unit
No. escription Quantity ni
Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
BID SCHEDULE “A” - SLURRY SEAL TYPE Il
Al :Ttir;ijgléns;;;;ﬂil Slurry Seat Type 1,250,000 SF
NO BID NC BID
SUB TOTAL - BID SCHEDULE “A~
Comments

BID SCHEDRULE “B” - LIGHT WEIGHT AGGREGATE CHIP SEAL

Fumish and I[nstall Light Weight SF

B1 Aggregate Chip Seal 2,000,000 $0.46 $920,000.00
Fumnish and Install 4" Double Solid

B2 Yellow Line 2,350 LF $2.00 F4,700.00
Furnish and Instalt Step Bar

B3 Pavement Marking 8 EA NO BID $60.00 $480.00
Furmish and Install Cross Walk

B4 Pavement Marking 7 EA $475.00 $3,325.00
Fumish and Install Scheol

B5 Pavement Marking 6 EA $135.00 $510.00

SUB TOTAL - BID SCHEDLLE “B” $929,315.00
Comments
BID SCHEDULE “C” - ROTO-MILL AND ASPHALT OVERLAY

Remove, Adjust and Reinstall

C1 Concrete Collars Around Water 17 EA $760.00 $12,920.00 $855.00 $14,535.00
Valves and Survey Monuments
Remove, Adjust and Reinstall

c2 Concrate Collars Around Manhole 15 EA $1,125.00 $16,875.00 $1,170.00 $17.,550.00
Roto-Mill Edge of Existing

Cc3 Roadways (taper 2" below lip of 5,900 LF $2.58 $15,222.00 $2.50 $14,750.00

ca Furnish and Install Level Course 200 TON $143.00 $28,600.00 $188.00 $37,600.00

- Py
cs i:;ﬂ:ﬂ and Install 234" PG 84-28 145,000 SF $1.97 | §285,650.00 $2.36 | $342,200.00
SUB TOTAL - BID SCHEDULE *C* $359,267.00 $426,635.00
Commenis
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